
Preliminary Bid Results Summary – Bid Number 11-12.014 

Panasonic Toughbook Laptop Computers & Accessories       Thursday, February 23, 2012      3:00 PM

COMPANY NAME

QUANTITY

ITEMS
PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES PRICE EACH TOTAL NOTES

Panasonic Toughbook, 9 4,529.98$   40,769.82$      NO 

ADDENDUM
3,618.00$  32,562.00$  ADDENDUM 

OK
4,310.13$  38,791.17$  NO 

ADDENDUM
3,821.25$  34,391.25$  NO 

ADDENDUM
3,730.00$  33,570.00$  NO 

ADDENDUM
4,532.00$  40,788.00$  NO 

ADDENDUM
4,333.00$     38,997.00$  NO 

ADDENDUM
3,710.00$  33,390.00$  ADDENDUM 

OK
4,711.00$  42,399.00$  NO 

ADDENDUM

P/N CF-31JBG EA1M

12”  PDRC Mk3 with 

associated backlit keyboard

19 389.98$       $         7,409.62 BID 

INCORRECT  

ITEM

1,440.00$  27,360.00$  371.93$      3,347.37$     BID 

INCORRECT  

ITEM

320.99$      6,098.81$     BID 

INCORRECT  

ITEM

1,464.00$  27,816.00$  379.00$      7,201.00$     BID 

INCORRECT  

ITEM

369.00$        7,011.00$     BID 

INCORRECT  

ITEM

1,461.23$  27,763.37$  363.00$      6,897.00$     BID 

INCORRECT  

ITEM

P/N CF-VKBL03AM

Panasonic vehicle mount 

port replicator with dual pass 

thru 

12  $      469.98  $         5,639.76 475.00$      5,700.00$     459.72$      5,516.64$     450.07$      5,400.84$     450.00$      5,400.00$     475.00$      5,700.00$     463.00$        5,556.00$     759.00$      9,108.00$     BID DIFFERENT 

ITEM
450.00$      5,400.00$     

P/N CF-WEB301MB

Electronics Box, Tray 

Mounted (Go Rhino)

15 -$             -$                   NO BID  $        30.00 450.00$        -$             -$               NO BID -$             -$               NO BID 680.00$      10,200.00$  BID 

INCORRECT  

ITEM

-$             -$               NO BID -$               -$               NO BID -$             -$               NO BID 62.00$        930.00$        

P/N VM-29003

PDRC Mk3.0 Cable Kit – 

25”SVGA, 15” Serial USB to 

connect item 1

11 -$             -$                   NO BID 50.00$        550.00$        21.59$        237.49$        -$             -$               NO BID 120.00$      1,320.00$     -$             -$               NO BID 137.00$        1,507.00$     49.00$        539.00$        24.00$        264.00$        

DC 120w Power Supply – 

Mountable, P/N LIND-PA 

1580-3207

25 139.98$      3,499.50$         115.00$      2,875.00$     122.80$      3,070.00$     -$             -$               NO BID 114.00$      2,850.00$     -$             -$               NO BID 117.00$        2,925.00$     115.96$      2,899.00$     117.00$      2,925.00$     

DC Filtered Power Supply for 

MDRC Mk3.0
7 239.98$      1,679.86$         220.00$      1,540.00$     233.67$      1,635.69$     109.75$      768.25$        211.00$      1,477.00$     -$             -$               NO BID 216.00$        1,512.00$     211.96$      1,483.72$     218.00$      1,526.00$     

P/N LIND-PA 1540I-3486

Pan Protection Plus 

Warranty 4 year for laptop, 
9 169.98$      1,529.82$         BID PART # CF-

SVCPSNF4Y
380.00$      3,420.00$     NO TAX? 429.04$      3,861.36$     609.91$      5,489.19$     380.00$      3,420.00$     -$             -$               NO BID 425.00$        3,825.00$     378.30$      3,404.70$     510.00$      4,590.00$     

P/N WR-104001

PDRC Warranty Extension 

(Year 4)
19 -$             -$                   NO BID 38.00$        722.00$        NO TAX? 42.91$        815.29$        -$             -$               NO BID 41.00$        779.00$        -$             -$               NO BID 221.00$        4,199.00$     40.33$        766.27$        64.00$        1,216.00$     

WR-104005

California E-Waste Recycle 

Act Fee for Monitors (4”-15”)
28 -$             -$                   NO BID 6.00$          168.00$        NO TAX? -$             -$               NO BID 6.00$          168.00$        6.00$          168.00$        8.00$          224.00$        55.00$          1,540.00$     8.00$          224.00$        15.00$        420.00$        

          

SUBTOTAL 60,528.38$      75,347.00$  57,275.01$  52,316.34$  87,000.00$  53,913.00$  67,072.00$  79,578.06$  66,567.00$  

TAX

5,447.55$         6,781.23$     INCLUDES TAX 

ON 3 ITEMS
5,154.75$     4,708.47$     7,830.00$     4,852.17$     6,036.48$     7,162.03$     5,991.03$     

SHIPPING -$                   600.00$        -$               -$               1,675.00$     -$               -$               -$               -$               

TOTAL 65,975.93$      82,728.23$  62,429.76$  57,024.81$  96,505.00$  58,765.17$  73,108.48$  86,740.09$  72,558.03$  

ANTICIPATED 

DELIVERY

15-20 DAYS 

ARO
45 DAYS ARO NO DATE LISTED 10-15 DAYS 

ARO
3/25/2012 8-10 WEEKS 45 DAYS ARO 14-21 DAYS 

ARO

30 DAYS ARO

CDCE   ONLY VENDOR TO BID OUT ALL 

ITEMS CORRECTLY

HOWARD TECHNOLOGY MOBILETEK CONSULTING OAKLAND COMPUTER COMPANY THE PORTABLE WAREHOUSE TRWBUSINESS SERVICES CDCE, INC. CDW-GOVT EN POINTE TECHNOLOGIES GOVWARE LLC


