BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 01-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF ALUMINUM SULFATE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay
Optional Bid Marin-
[ronhouse Sonoma-
North Bay Sanitary South Bay Napa Sacramento
Unit Price District Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Thatcher Company of CA $0.635 $2.780 $0.703 $0.649 $0.5798
Univar USA Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EcoServices Operations LLC $1.2656 No Bid $1.2656 $1.2656 $1.2656
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC $S0.5636 No Bid $0.5840 $0.5725 $0.5239
Sierra Chemical Co. $0.796 $2.53 $0.796 $0.796 $0.796

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 02-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF AMMONIUM SULFATE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

East Bay South Bay Tri-Valley
40% Liquid Solution 40% Liquid Solution  25% Dry Material

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Lb.
Brenntag Pacific, Inc. $2.67 $2.72 $0.56
Univar USA Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sierra Chemical Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC $2.68 $5.62 No Bid

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 03-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF AQUEOUS AMMONIA

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay East Bay
19% Solution 19% Solution

Unit Price Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon Per Gallon
Airgas Specialty Products, Inc. $7.74 $1.2559
Hill Brothers Chemical Company $7.66 $1.07
Thatcher Company of California, Inc. No Bid No Bid
Sierra Chemical Co. No Bid No Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

South Bay
19% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$0.9559

$1.02

No Bid

No Bid

Peninsula
19% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$7.74

$7.66

No Bid

No Bid

Tri-Valley
19% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$7.74

$4.64

No Bid

No Bid

Marin-Sonoma-
Napa
30% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$7.74

$4.48

No Bid

No Bid



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 04-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CALCIUM NITRATE
OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

BIDDER

Univar USA Inc.

Evoqua Water Technologies LLC

Thatcher Company of California, Inc.

Sierra Chemical Co.

Peninsula
Unit Price Per Lb.
of Nitrate-Oxygen

No Bid

$0.5035

$0.5057

No Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

Peninsula
Unit Price Per Gallon
Calcium Nitrate
Solution

No Bid

$2.165

$1.77

No Bid

Marin-Sonoma-Napa
Unit Price Per Lb.
of Nitrate-Oxygen

No Bid

$0.5035

$0.5057

No Bid

Marin-Sonoma-Napa
Unit Price Per Gallon
Calcium Nitrate
Solution

No Bid

$2.165

$1.77

No Bid



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 05-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF CITRIC ACID

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay North Bay Tri-Valley

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon Per Dry Lb. Per Gallon
Sierra Chemical Co. $6.13 $1.186 $6.13
Brenntag Pacific, Inc. $6.13 $1.05 $6.13
Northstar Chemical No Bid No Bid No Bid
Univar USA Inc. $6.01 $1.16 $6.01
Thatcher Company of CA $5.87 $1.1354 $6.14

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

Tri-Valley
Unit Price

Per Dry Lb.

$1.06

$1.05

No Bid

$1.16

$1.1876

Central Valley
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$6.13

$6.13

No Bid

$6.01

$6.60

Central Valley
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$1.186

$1.05

No Bid

$1.16

$1.2766

Sacramento
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$6.13

$6.13

No Bid

$6.01

$6.12

Sacramento
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$1.186

$1.05

No Bid

$1.16

$1.1838



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 06-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF FERRIC CHLORIDE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

Marin-Sonoma-

East Bay South Bay Tri-Valley Peninsula Napa Central Valley

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
BIDDER Per Dry Ton Per Dry Ton Per Dry Ton Per Dry Ton Per Dry Ton Per Dry Ton
Kemira Water Solutions $522.00 $544.00 $522.00 $550.00 $555.00 $486.00
Thatcher Company of California $492.23 $495.25 $484.70 $495.70 $484.69 $495.65
California Water Technologies $845.00 $845.00 $845.00 $845.00 $845.00 $845.00
Pencco, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sierra Chemical Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Univar USA Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)
BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 07-2015
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF FERROUS CHLORIDE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay

Unit Price
BIDDER Per Dry Ton
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. $610.00
California Water Technologies, LLC $618.00
Thatcher Company of California, Inc. No Bid
Sierra Chemical Co. No Bid
Pencco Inc. No Bid
Univar USA Inc. No Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

East Bay
Unit Price
Per Dry Ton

$610.00

$618.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Tri-Valley
Unit Price
Per Dry Ton

$650.00

$618.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Peninsula
Unit Price
Per Dry Ton

$650.00

$618.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)
BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 08-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF HYDROFLUOSILICIC ACID

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay

Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon
BHS Marketing LLC $2.51
Brenntag Pacific, Inc. $2.28
Mosaic Global Sales, LLC $2.187
Sierra Chemical Co. No Bid
Univar USA Inc. No Bid
Pencco, Inc. No Bid
Thatcher Company of California, Inc. No Bid

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.

The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

East Bay
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$2.69
$2.32
$2.187
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Tri-Valley

Unit Price

Per Gallon
$3.40
$3.13
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Marin-Sonoma-
Napa
Unit Price
Per Gallon
$2.95
$2.28
$2.187
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Sacramento
Unit Price
Per Gallon

$3.18
$2.32
$2.187
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 09-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF HYDROGEN PEROXIDE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

Marin-Sonoma-Napa

Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon
Thatcher Company of California, Inc. $3.47
Evoqua Water Technologies LLC $2.25
U.S. Peroxide, LLC $2.07
Sierra Chemical Co. No Bid
Univar USA Inc. No Bid

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 10-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF LIQUID CHLORINE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay South Bay Sacramento

One-Ton Cylinders  One-Ton Cylinders  One-Ton Cylinders
BIDDER Unit Price Per Ton  Unit Price Per Ton  Unit Price Per Ton
Northstar Chemical No Bid No Bid No Bid
Thatcher Company of California, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Olin Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid
Univar USA Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sierra Chemical Co. $592.18 $602.39 $704.49

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)
BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 12-2015
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF SODIUM BISULFITE
OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

BIDDER

Brenntag Pacific, Inc.

Univar USA Inc.

Chemurgic

Sierra Chemical Co.

Thatcher Company of California

North Bay
25% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

No Bid

$0.844

$1.20

No Bid

No Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any

indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

East Bay
25% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

No Bid

$0.844

$1.01

No Bid

No Bid

South Bay
25% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

No Bid

$0.90

$1.035

No Bid

No Bid

Peninsula
25% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

No Bid

$0.844

$1.06

No Bid

No Bid

Marin-Sonoma-
Napa
25% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

No Bid

$0.844

$1.08

No Bid

No Bid

Sacramento
40% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

No Bid

$4.79

$2.50

No Bid

No Bid

Central Valley
40% Solution
Unit Price
Per Gallon

No Bid

$4.79

$2.50

No Bid

No Bid



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)
BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 13-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF SODIUM HYDROXIDE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

BIDDER

Univar USA Inc.

Brenntag Pacific, Inc.

Olin Corporation

Northstar Chemical

Sierra Chemical Co.

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.

North Bay
30% NaOH
Unit Price

Per Dry Lb.

$0.228

$0.2035

$0.252

No Bid

No Bid

North Bay
50% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.2075

$0.1970

$0.24

No Bid

No Bid

East Bay
25% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.2391

$0.2035

$0.264

No Bid

No Bid

East Bay
50% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.207

$0.1970

$0.242

No Bid

No Bid

East Bay

Optional Bid
Item
Union Sanitary
District
50% NaOH
Unit Price Per
Dry Lb.

$0.95

$0.95

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

South Bay
25% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.223

$0.2450

$0.31

No Bid

No Bid

South Bay
50% NaOH
Unit Price

Per Dry Lb.

$0.2074

$0.1970

$0.21

No Bid

No Bid

Tri-Valley
25% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.2389

$0.2075

$0.26

No Bid

No Bid

Marin-Sonoma-

Tri-Valley Napa
50% NaOH 25% NaOH
Unit Price Unit Price
Per Dry Lb. Per Dry Lb.
$0.212 $0.2389
$0.1970 $0.2075
$0.24 $0.268
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

Marin-Sonoma-
Napa
50% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.207

$0.1970

$0.245

No Bid

No Bid

Central Valley
25% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.2389

$0.2035

$0.26

No Bid

No Bid

Central Valley
50% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.2095

$0.1970

$0.238

No Bid

No Bid

Sacramento
25% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.2674

$0.2075

$0.29

No Bid

No Bid

Sacramento
30% NaOH
Unit Price
Per Dry Lb.

$0.259

$0.2035

$0.29

No Bid

No Bid

Sacramento
50% NaOH
Unit Price

Per Dry Lb.

$0.2219

$0.1970

$0.29

No Bid

No Bid



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 14-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF 12.5% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE
OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay South Bay Sacramento
Optional Bid South Bay Optional Bid Optional Bid
ltem Optional Bid ltem ltem
Ironhouse ltem City of Morgan Marin-Sonoma- Place County
North Bay Sanitary District East Bay South Bay City of Gilroy Hill Tri-Valley Peninsula Napa Sacramento Water Agency Central Valley
Unit Price Unit Price Per Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Per  Unit Price Per Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Per Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Gallon Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Gallon Per Gallon
Hasa Inc. $0.715 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.756 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Univar USA Inc. $0.4015 $1.9933 $0.4111 $0.4105 $2.71 $1.9186 $0.4025 $0.425 $0.5210 $0.5210 $2.71 $0.4685
Olin Corporation $0.505 No Bid $0.505 $0.415 No Bid No Bid $0.505 $0.525 $0.535 $0.545 No Bid $0.505
Sierra Chemical Co. $0.80 $1.85 $0.80 $0.80 $2.20 $2.05 $0.80 $0.80 $0.80 $0.80 $2.60 $0.80
Northstar Chemical No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Thatcher Company of California No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 15-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF SULFUR DIOXIDE

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

Central Valley

Unit Price
BIDDER Per Lb.
Univar USA Inc. No Bid
Thatcher Company of California, Inc. No Bid
Sierra Chemical Co. S0.44

Apparent Low Bid

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



BAY AREA CHEMICAL CONSORTIUM (BACC)

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 16-2015

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF SULFURIC ACID

OPEN DATE: TUESDAY, APRIL 14, 2015 @ 9:00 A.M. PDT

North Bay South Bay Central Valley Sacramento

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
BIDDER Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Northstar Chemical $1.35 $1.38 $2.85 $1.38
Univar USA Inc. $1.30 $1.30 $2.93 $1.30
Brenntag Pacific, Inc. $1.128 $1.108 $3.54 $1.128
Sierra Chemical Co. $1.28 $1.32 $2.83 $1.38

All bids submitted are reflected on this bid sheet.
The listing of a bid should not be construed as any
indication that BACC accepts such bid as responsive.



