
 
 
 
*tire fee N/A 
per 
specifications, 
price corrected 

Bid 
Number 

Bid Title Make/Model Price EACH Extended 
Price 

Bidders 

 
04-05.011 

 
Two (2) ¾-Ton, 2WD, Pick-ups 

Ford F250 
Chevrolet Silverado CC25903 
Dodge Ram 2500 DH2L62 
Ford F250 F20 
2005 Ford F250 
Ford F-250 

$16,655.00 
$18,137.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$16,224.00 (+ $5 tire fee)* 
$17,483.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$16,719.18 
$16,803.18 

$33,110.00 
$36,284.00 
$32,448.00 
$34,976.00 
$33,438.36 
$33,606.36 

Burch Ford 
Century Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 

 
04-05.012 

 
One (1) 2WD, Crew-
Cab/Chassis 
 

Crew Ford F350 
Chevrolet Silverado CC35943 
No Bid 
Ford F350 W36 
2005 Ford F350 Crew 
Ford F350 

$21,632.00 
$22,407.00 (+ $7 tire fee) 
No Bid 
$22,076.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$20,360.18 
$21,407.18 

$21,632.00 
$22,414.00 
No Bid 
$22,083.00 
$20,360.18 
$21,407.18 

Burch Ford 
Century Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 

 
04-05.013 

 
One (1) 2WD, 4-Door Sedan 
 

Taurus Ford S.E. 
Chevrolet Malibu 12569 
Dodge Stratus JRDH41 
Ford Taurus P53 
2005 Ford Taurus 
Ford Taurus 

$14,072.00 
$14,559.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
Not to specifications 
$14,850.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$14,686.90 
$14,321.90 

$14,072.00 
$14,564.00 
$- 
$14,855.00 
$14,686.90 
$14,321.90 

Burch Ford 
Century Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 

 
04-05.014 

 
Two (2) 2WD, 4-Door Sedans 
 

Taurus Ford S.E. 
Chevrolet Malibu 12569 
Dodge Stratus JRDH41 
Ford Taurus 
2005 Ford  Taurus 
Ford Taurus 

$14,072.00 
$14,559.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
Not to specifications 
$14,850.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$14,686.90 
$14,321.90 

$28,144.00 
$29,128.00 
$- 
$29,710.00 
$29,373.80 
$28,643.80 

Burch Ford 
Century Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 

 
04-05.015 

 
One (1) 2WD, Compact Pick-up 
 

Ranger Ford RC 
Chevrolet Colorado CS15403 
No Bid 
Ford Ranger R10 
2005 Ford Ranger 
Ford Ranger 

$12,864.00 
$13,095.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
No Bid 
$13,326.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$13,068.95 
$12,378.95 

$12,864.00 
$13,100.00 
No Bid 
$13,331.00 
$13,068.95 
$12,378.95 

Burch Ford 
Century Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 

 
04-05.016 

 
Eight (8) Police Patrol Vehicles 
 

Crown Vic Ford Police 
No Bid 
No Bid 
Ford Police Interceptor Base P71 
2005 Ford Crown Victoria 
Ford Crown Victoria 

$21,983.00 
No Bid 
No Bid 
$22,590.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$21,877.95 
$21,974.95 

$175,864.00 
No Bid 
No Bid 
$180,760.00 
$175,023.60 
$175,799.60 

Burch Ford 
Century Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 

 
04-05.017 

 
One (1) 2WD Extended-Cab 
Compact Pick-up 

Ranger Ford SC 
Chevrolet Colorado CS15653 
Dodge Dakota Club Cab ND1L33 
Ford Ranger R14 
2005 Ford Ranger S/C 
Ford Ranger 

$13,267.00 
$14,220.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$15,044.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$14,657.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$13,471.95 
$13,416.95 

$13,267.00 
$14,225.00 
$15,049.00 
$14,662.00 
$13,471.95 
$13,416.95 

Burch Ford 
Century Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 

 
04-05.018 

 
One (1) 2WD Cargo Van 

Ford #150 Cargo 
Chevrolet Express CG13405 
No Bid 
Ford Econoline E150 E14 
2005 Ford Econoline 
Ford Econoline  

$14,319.00 
$14,809.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
No Bid 
$15,339.00 (+ $5 tire fee) 
$14,509.81 
$14,468.81 

$14,319.00 
$14,814.00 
No Bid 
$15,344.00 
$14,509.81 
$14,468.81 

Burch Ford 
Centrury Chevrolet 
Hoblit Haynes Dodge 
Hoblit Motors 
Melrose Ford 
S&C Ford 


